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A Quick Note on Scope

Being a good admin requires a lot of skills beyond just HubSpot knowledge:

● Systems thinking

● Documentation

● Goal setting

● Strategy

● Logic

● Curiosity

● Etc…

For this presentation, we’ll focus solely on the HubSpot features and tools that will 
help you implement, optimize, and troubleshoot your HubSpot account. But if you 
want to learn these other skills…



Join the HubSpot Admins User Group!

Weekly webinars on useful skills and 
HubSpot hacks!

See upcoming events here: 
https://events.hubspot.com/hubspot-admins/

(Or just scan the QR code!)

We have an in-person meetup at the 
Sprocketeer Lounge today at 4:00!

https://events.hubspot.com/hubspot-admins/


Follow #HubSpotTipsAndTricks

Daily HubSpot feature updates 
posted to LinkedIn, Twitter, 
Instagram, and Facebook!

HubSpot Tips and Tricks
hubspottips
hubspottipsandtricks
HubSpot Tips and Tricks



IMPLEMENTING HUBSPOT
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Properties Cheat Sheet!

This PDF is THE BEST resource on 
HubSpot’s default properties that’s 
ever been created (probably).

You should be able to access this 
from the INBOUND mobile app, but 
here’s a link just in case:

bit.ly/hubspotpropertiescheatsheet
Another QR!

http://bit.ly/hubspotpropertiescheatsheet


Basic Implementation

Things you should know about 
properties:

● Field type

● Rules (text, date, or number only)

● Calculations*

● Field-level permissions**

● COMING SOON: Conditional Logic*

Properties

*Professional subscription required **Enterprise subscription required

10 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/36fa57423d24428abc2e64d1203f6d0b?sid=c017cf03-bd67-47fd-912f-d04d186cde82


Basic Implementation

HubSpot’s importing tool has a lot of 
powerful features built into it:

● Data validation

● Create properties on the fly

● Unique IDs

● Association in imports

● Post-import results

● Repeat an import

Imports

All HubSpot Subscriptions

10 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/2df91451cd624fd1b9fe2e854cf0e5ae?sid=b44022e9-3369-4d14-a709-af66ce3efb36


Basic Implementation

Things you should know about users:

● Users

● Seats

● Teams

● Presets*

● Permission sets**

Users

*Professional subscription required **Enterprise subscription required

10 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/b63b2792c83d48e6b4362629bc59c5cb?sid=b7e0a7be-45e3-4f9c-b372-d52e8a6eee68
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Intermediate Implementation

Things you should know about views:

● Filters (and useful properties)

● Preview pane

● Inline editing

● Emojis and Tags*

● Board customization*
(by pipeline**)

Views

*Sales Hub Starter **Sales Hub Professional

8 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/580f19cb2c474c39ac336f6017b99e8c?sid=c3e3abd7-6a2c-4bed-8ca1-0c1c0c0b7ef5


Intermediate Implementation

Things you should know about 
records:

● Sidebars*

● Center column*

● Card customization**

● Record creation form*

Records

*Functionality varies by subscription **Starter subscription required

6 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/ef56df2fa7f74a8589b95a8116e04a92?sid=82fd684f-ec24-4753-9bfc-615b42cd6a25


Intermediate Implementation

Things you should know about Data 
Sync integrations:

● Setup

● Fix Formatting Issues*

Data Sync

*Operations Hub Starter (Professional for automation)

6 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/1a91f8d4fdda46c18ff942468b6abab4?sid=75e12e14-b5ef-41dc-93a8-c168d1353013
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Advanced Implementation

Things you should know about 
objects:

● Data model overview

● Custom objects*

Objects

*Enterprise subscription required

4 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/a2dc8c404c6b4952989ca4a7d3fc1527?sid=d3d181b1-dc9d-4c77-a10c-569891a419b0


Advanced Implementation

Things you should know about 
associations:

● Customize cards*

● Custom labels**

● In workflows** and reports

● COMING SOON: Same-object 
associations!

Associations

*Starter subscription required **Professional subscription required

6 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/cc6e284706814f95a926485f44c8ee49?sid=4b3885c4-a119-4ee0-a3df-229e7428240e


Advanced Implementation

Things you should know about 
sandboxes:

● They exist

Sandboxes*

*Enterprise subscription required

2 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/076c25cfb3b04aef9e10d66db64b5b94?sid=6294f03d-fad3-4fc3-953a-d3a65ee13b03


Let’s Shuffle!

Source: Pexels
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Basic Optimization

Things you should know about 
reports:

● Standard reports and dashboards

● Custom reports*

● Customizing dashboards

Reports

*Professional subscription required

6 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/8c24b6b0234a42c2ba1ef98693d36005?sid=fc44f0db-0f31-4066-b5f7-b3aa35daf462


Basic Optimization

Things you should know about 
reports:

● You can also access your 
dashboards in the mobile app!

Reports

All HubSpot Subscriptions



Basic Optimization

Things you should know about 
workflows:

● Organizing

● Actions

● Data panel

Workflows*

*Professional subscription required

6 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/c82c15a1f31c4af6b86eefa6d632c0c6?sid=74c843df-f52b-4dc3-ae0f-1132257197f5
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Intermediate Optimization

Things you should know about 
Marketing Hub:

● Content assistant

● Collaboration sidebar

● Campaigns*

● Approvals**

Marketing Hub

*Professional subscription required **Enterprise subscription required

5 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/52b1c4a189704167aa4230785ed71198?sid=a6ce473d-e5f3-454d-a183-f3c1915dd456


Intermediate Optimization

Things you should know about Sales 
Hub:

● Content assistant

● Forecasting*

● Prospecting*

● Handoffs*

Sales Hub

*Professional seat required

14 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/d0fe7a3b2a46452d9f0073be2240ef38?sid=cc97688a-e36f-4deb-b4d7-55f4ebb8d7a6


Intermediate Optimization

Things you should know about 
Service Hub:

● Content assistant

● Customer portal*

● Capacity limits**

Service Hub

*Professional subscription required **Enterprise seat required

4 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/79baef39ba074870b0e712cac346ec57?sid=2e6e2eb0-d98c-479a-b9ff-ac3fde23997c
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Advanced Optimization

Things you should know about 
Operations Hub:

● Data quality command center*

● Workflow upgrades*

● Datasets**

● Snowflake data share**

Operations Hub

*Professional subscription required **Enterprise subscription required

10 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/0a1cdfd3db71468db3b1c061aa1983e2?sid=5616db90-ba9e-4939-9e9f-61ae7ef8f706


Advanced Optimization

Things you should know about CMS 
Hub:

● Content assistant

● Templates

● HubDB*

● Adaptive testing**

CMS Hub

*CMS Professional or Marketing Enterprise **CMS/Marketing Enterprise

6 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/12c356415ede418faa746f2c8a6f728c?sid=0f128f2f-be47-47d5-aa93-a30705963dc8


Let’s Shuffle!

Source: Pexels
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Basic Troubleshooting

Things you should know about 
histories:

● Property history

● Association history

● Merge IDs property

● Export contact data

Histories

All HubSpot Subscriptions

3 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/5959b6cf70d84144abbfaf399446e3e0?sid=f3014af5-766c-4392-b51d-e16933c44a38


Basic Troubleshooting

Things you should know about logs:

● Login history

● HubSpot employee access history

● Security activity history

● Content activity history*

● Centralized audit log**

Logs

*CMS Enterprise Only **All Enterprise Subscriptions

2 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/f6b4cab51c9844c1bab687775e8ae175?sid=df19e1ec-ecfb-4409-8243-4c1685a6ea47


Basic Troubleshooting

Things you should know about the 
Security Center:

● Rating

● Measures

● Actions

Security Center

All HubSpot Subscriptions

1 minute

https://www.loom.com/share/d6754ab7afbe462a89ee9de5d5dacabb?sid=33645533-c8da-47ae-927d-08b844fcb43f
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Intermediate Troubleshooting

Things you should know about 
troubleshooting workflows:

● “Needs review” tab

● Issues detail panel

● Action logs

● Enrollment testing

● Re-enrollment

Workflows*

*Professional subscription required

5 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/9f3ae3924d4944b48f28e52ae048345d?sid=5622e0af-daac-48ab-8bb7-4fbeb72274c4


Things you should know about 
troubleshooting reports:

● Filters

● Refresh rates

Reports

All HubSpot Subscriptions

Intermediate Troubleshooting

5 minutes

https://www.loom.com/share/e12974775f124c72b617b3860f615d0d?sid=e870fb3e-1c15-4ced-8e6f-d2685b7b446a
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Advanced Troubleshooting

Things you should know about user 
impersonation:

● Only available to super admins

● You can’t impersonate another 
admin user

● You can’t change user permissions 
while impersonating another user

● Sessions limited to 30 minutes.

User Impersonation*

*Enterprise subscription required

1 minute

https://www.loom.com/share/889e664c9ba24afca12fd4c05ebdbe8d?sid=59cfdf2d-27af-4003-bb25-9f3d39dde6ce


AMA AND NEXT STEPS



Download This Deck!

While I’m up here answering 
questions, feel free to download a 
PDF version of this presentation:

bit.ly/kylejepson2023

http://bit.ly/kylejepson2023


THANK YOU
events.hubspot.com/hubspot-admins/

HubSpot Tips and Tricks

hubspottips

hubspottipsandtricks

HubSpot Tips and Tricks
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